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On to College: What high school students and their families need to know about college selection,
application and admissions. A college education is likely to be one of the most important and expensive
investments you will make in a lifetime, yet most students often lack the knowledge they need to choose and
apply to the programs that will best suit their needs and interests. With many years of insider experience in
college counseling and teaching, authors Kost and Don reveal for the first time proven strategies to be a
savvy applicant, cut costs, and evaluate the hidden quality of a program—the single most important and
neglected aspect of the process. Make your application essay stand out by using the authors’ proven
strategies. Learn the secrets of fortifying your application without padding your resume. Use the tips and
comprehensive timeline to stay focused, organized--and in front of college admissions officers. Follow the
templates to effectively request letters of recommendation and compile an activities list and resume that will
highlight your accomplishments. Understand the upcoming changes to the SAT and PSAT and why they are
to your advantage. Get information about athletics directly from Division 1 coaches to be sure you have what
they are looking for and be aware of the reasons to consider other ways of participating in sports. Find
invaluable hints for artists of all kinds about auditions and portfolios and how to decide between specialized
art schools and a more comprehensive university. Be inspired to consider attending universities in other
countries from Canada to Israel and Australia to save money and time (3-year programs are more common)
and acquire international experience. Truly a stand out among the college guides, On To College will be your
indispensable go-to resource every step of the way.
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From reader reviews:

Eleonora Plunkett:

The reserve untitled On To College: What high school students and their families need to know about college
selection, application, and admissions is the reserve that recommended to you to learn. You can see the
quality of the publication content that will be shown to you. The language that writer use to explained their
way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of study when write the book,
therefore the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-
book of On To College: What high school students and their families need to know about college selection,
application, and admissions from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Keith Smith:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for your requirements is On To College: What high school students and their families need to
know about college selection, application, and admissions this book consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how does the world has grown up. The
terminology styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book ideal all of you.

Johnny Relyea:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This On To College: What high school
students and their families need to know about college selection, application, and admissions can be the
respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this
fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Jamie Ault:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This On To College: What high school students and their
families need to know about college selection, application, and admissions can give you a lot of good friends
because by you checking out this one book you have matter that they don't and make you more like an
interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information
that might be your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than different make you to be great folks. So , why
hesitate? Let us have On To College: What high school students and their families need to know about
college selection, application, and admissions.
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