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The first book from International Award Winning Artist J. A. George AKA; The GYPSY. BLOGGING
KANSAS is a collection of original essays written by The GYPSY and derived from his numerous and most
popular Blogs with one central theme; Kansas. Loaded with original art and photographs by The GYPSY
that inspired a majority of his writings you will find this book of opinions, short stories and poetry hard to
put down. A very revealing look into the heart and mind of a Tattoo Artist, Biker, Adventurer, Entrepreneur
and a True Renaissance Man. Earnest, poignant and oft times humorous you will find plenty of laughter,
tears and thought-provoking food for the soul. Excerpt From The Story "A Debt Repaid and A Blizzard
Endured": I watched the tornado cross the Interstate less than a half mile from where I sat under an
overpass. It was early May of 1982 and this was just another moment in a trip, by the time it was completed,
that included, a trip on Braniff airlines last flight during a thunderstorm, hot sex in a wet tent, good times
with old friends, a flood, a night spent in a bathroom of a turnpike rest area and running out of gas less than
20 miles from home. We won't even mention the loss of my headlight, the loss of oil due to an over-
enthusiastic service station attendant and dining on gnats washed down with a tasty glass of Texas ground
water. No, we won't mention those things because they are another story entirely and will reveal themselves
as a chapter in my upcoming book. The story that I am going to relate here today deals with the tornado,
(previously mentioned), lost keys, a fried generator and a long overdo debt repaid. Excerpt From The Story
"A Love Story": I held a single red rose in my hand to greet her with. As she approached her smile widened
and she grabbed the sides of her long leather coat. With a mischievous tilt of her head she pulled her coat
open like a flasher in the park. Except instead of bare flesh she revealed a black t-shirt with bold white letters
that proclaimed, “REMEMBER MY NAME YOU’LL BE SCREAMING IT LATER.” The shirt proved to
be prophetic. Excerpt From The Story "The Night Santa Saved Christmas": The wind rustled the plastic
on the windows at 433 East High popping the artificial storm windows in and out like the breathing of some
transparent rectangular monster trapped within the window frame. This was made even more unsettling by
the fact that the plastic adorned the windows on the inside of the house and not the outside. Jimmy and Patty
sat on the couch, a blanket wrapped around their bodies to insulate them from the cold. The floor heater
cracked and groaned but did little good to chase off the cold in the drafty un-insulated little house on
Topeka’s east side. Jimmy and Patty watched the old GE black and white TV reflect back images of Bing
Crosby as he, Rosemary Clooney, Vera Ellen and Danny Kaye sang about a White Christmas. Jimmy looked
over at the little tree in the corner, the red, green and gold bubble lights sending their tiny endless stream of
bubbles up the tubes to go nowhere and disappear in the glass tip of the cylinder. He then looked back at the
black and white image of the tree behind the four singers and though their tree was gray within the flickering
image Jimmy knew it was a grander tree than he would ever have.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Schwartz:

The book Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume
1) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable far more increase. Book can
for being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make
studying a book Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series)
(Volume 1) to be your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase
your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like available and read
a e-book Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume
1). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think
about this guide?

Richard Burnett:

This Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume 1)
book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading
this book will be information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper
you read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz
(The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume 1) without we understand teach the one who reading it
become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of
Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume 1) can bring once you are and not make your bag space
or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even phone. This Blogging
Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume 1) having fine
arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Siobhan Wilcox:

Beside this particular Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book
Series) (Volume 1) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or
details. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so don't become worry
if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Blogging Kansas: Musings
From The Land of Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume 1) because this book offers for you
readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what it's all about. Oh come on, that
will not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and read it from today!

Florence Ross:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Blogging Kansas: Musings From The Land of



Oz (The GYPSY's Blogging Book Series) (Volume 1) can be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you
know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a
nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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