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In January 2006, 230 people raced in trucks, cars, and motorbikes from Lisbon to Dakar in the 28th annual
Dakar rally—the most challenging race in existence. Taking part was a team of three bikers—Matt Hall,
Simon Pavey, and actor and bike nut Charley Boorman. After his celebrated trip round the world with Ewan
McGregor, documented in Long Way Round, Charley was keen for another challenge. Racing in the Dakar
had always been a dream of his, and so it was the obvious choice for a new adventure. Supported by
Australian champion biker Simon Pavey and experienced British biker Matt Hall, Charley attempted to do
what many professional bikers have failed to do—to successfully compete in the Dakar rally. His book
details his extraordinary adventures and those of his fellow bikers, and also explores the history of this most
dramatic and romantic of races. From Portugal through Morocco, Western Sahara, Mauritania, Mali, Guinea,
and Senegal, it also provides a unique look at the countries hosting the rally. It is an exhilarating and fitting
sequel to Long Way Round.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Dabney:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Race to Dakar will make you to end up
being smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think
which open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they might be thought
like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Sonja Johnson:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or data even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you is you
don't know which you should start with. This Race to Dakar is our recommendation to make you keep up
with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Sarah Davis:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have you
got when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is definitely Race to Dakar.

Alexandra Dickey:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book mainly book entitled Race
to Dakar the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe
mysterious for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a e-book then
become one application form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get previous to. The
Race to Dakar giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you
useful information for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern
the following is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning
a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?
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