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‘The Autobiography of a Flea’ was initally published in 1887, and inspired a film directed by one of the first
female pornographic directors from the 1970s. Starring the inimitable John C Holmes, it is recognised as a
classic example of the x-rated genre.

Can men of the cloth ever escape temptation?

A young maiden, Bella, and her boyfriend Charlie consummate their passion under the moonlight, shrouded
in petticoats. Little do they know that someone has been watching them – a priest – who blackmails Bella
over the sight he has witnessed, enslaving her into a world of sexual subservience.

‘The Autobiography of a Flea’ is narrated by the smallest voyeur of them all, who uses his size to avenge
Bella's misfortune, revealing the sordid details of a priest's inner sanctum.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Tran:

The book The Autobiography of a Flea (Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics) gives you the sense of being
enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to get your best
friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make
examining a book The Autobiography of a Flea (Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics) to be your habit, you
can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open up and read a book The Autobiography of a Flea
(Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or
encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this book?

Saul Robinson:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day long to
reading a e-book. The book The Autobiography of a Flea (Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics) it doesn't
matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying
reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the particular e-book.
You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this
book has high quality.

Ann Morgan:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this The Autobiography of a Flea
(Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics) publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to
make book that can be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for
you, still dripping wet every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you
still skepticism The Autobiography of a Flea (Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics) as good book not merely
by the cover but also through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its
include, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already alerted you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Tracy Cluck:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is identified as
of book The Autobiography of a Flea (Harper Perennial Forbidden Classics). You can include your
knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you actually



happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place to other
place.
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