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American Indians worshiped them as creators of the world, Napoleon ate them to celebrate his victories,
Swedes have them shipped in from halfway around the world, and for Louisiana's Cajuns the humble
crawfish is the centerpiece of cuisine, a symbol of ethnic pride, a staple commodity for thriving business
ventures, and an inextricable part of folklore.

Research and interviews spice this delightful book that details the relationship between crawfish and
humans-from antiquity to the New York markets of the 1880s; from Depression-era pauper's feast to
gourmet entree of the 1980s Cajun cooking craze; from spring afternoon pastime to modern aquaculture
agribusiness.

To get the reader's mouth watering, more than two dozen recipes from those who know crawfish best-both
famous chefs and crawfishers-are interspersed throughout. Sections offer advice on catching, buying,
handling, cooking, and, for those who wish to simplify their encounters with crawfish, ordering tasty dishes
in restaurants. Included are also a bibliographical essay, an index to recipes, and a list of sources for spices,
paraphernalia, and airfreight shipments of crawfish.
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From reader reviews:

Christina McMullen:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. How about the person who
don't like reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or maybe exercise.
Well, probably you will need this The Crawfish Book.

Brett Munoz:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading through you
can get a lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write about
the information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this The
Crawfish Book.

Sandra Castillo:

The book with title The Crawfish Book has a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of
gain after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the
e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Andrew McConnell:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Crawfish Book can
be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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