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He is still the picture I have held in my had but blurred at the edges, like a photograph out of focus. His hair
is gone, his long, black, beautiful hair. It used to flow down his back, soft and shiny as night-water. Thinning
and greying now: any man's hair. And he wears a suit, any man's clothes. I look for what I used to know.
 
When Jo Devereux returns to Ireland after an absence of 20 years, the last person she expects to meet at her
mother's funeral is Rory O'Donovan. The unexplained conflict between his family and hers was the one
constant of Jo's childhood, leading to their painful breakup and Jo's sudden emigration. 

Now she's back in Mucknamore, the Irish village where they grew up, he's urging her to stay on after the
funeral and she's tempted. Because of him? Because her life in San Francisco is such a mess? Or because,
being a writer, she always swore that one day she'd write a book about it all? 

Jo settles into a shed near the beach to write her family history and begins to uncover some astonishing truths
about her mother and grandmother; about women's role in the conflict that became known as "The War of
The Brothers", and about the consequences of a murder that have ricocheted through the generations.

Rory, mired in an unhappy marriage, is urging her to rebel again -- but Jo is more cautious twenty years on.
"Rebellion has an energy that sweeps people up," she tells him, "but what happens after the rising?"

That's the question Jo must answer if her exhumation of the past is to redeem her future.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Whitaker:

The book After The Rising can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then
must we leave the good thing like a book After The Rising? A few of you have a different opinion about
book. But one aim this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with
the book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you may share all of
these. Book After The Rising has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive function for
you. You can appearance the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Albert Jones:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their story
as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of them is this
After The Rising.

Judy Marinez:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you
study a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend
on what kinds of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel,
comics, and also soon. The After The Rising provide you with new experience in reading a book.

Sylvia Ferland:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended to
your account is After The Rising this e-book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world
now. This particular book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that
writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some research when he makes this
book. Here is why this book ideal all of you.
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